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Our next ‘Meet the teacher’ and ‘Book Look’ 
session has been booked for next Wednesday, 
22nd October from 3.30 - 4.30pm.  
 
As well as providing parents with the opportunity 
to meet informally with their child’s class teacher 
this half term, this event offers an ideal  
opportunity for you to explore your child’s 
classroom and look at your children’s books / 
learning with your child, with class teachers on  
 
 

 
 
 

 

 
 

 
Head teacher’s Roundup Monday 6th October 2025 

 
 

 

 
 

Just a reminder that we are holding a  
‘Book Look’ and meet the class teacher  

event for parents on Wednesday October 22nd. 
 

  
 

Just a reminder that the school photograher will 
be in school to take portait photos of individuals 

and sibling groups tomorrow morning.  
 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 

An enormous thank you to everyone who 
supported our Wyton Marathon last week! 

 

  
 
Please label all your children’s belongings so they 
don’t become part of our lost property mountain! 
 

  
 

 
 
 

 
 

Dates for your diaries… 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Local library opening times… 
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hand to answer any queries you may have about 
any aspect of school life this term. 
 
If you are unable to attend, but wish to contact 
your child’s class teacher about any queries of 
concerns, please do not hesitate to contact them 
via the school office or email during school hours. 
Email addresses are as follows: 
 
Seahorses Pre-school Class: 
ESaunderson@wyton.school 
Angel Fish Reception Class:  
LPugh@wyton.school 
Years 1&2 Rainbow Fish Class - Mrs Giddings: 
KGiddings@wyton.school 
Years 3&4 Lionfish Class – Miss Wilson: 
CWilson@wyton.school 
Years 4&5 Manta Ray Class – Mrs Davenport: 
SDavenport@wyton.school 
Years 5&6 Guppy Class - Miss Mitchell: 
TMitchell@wyton.school 
Head teacher - Jo Phillips: 
head@wyton.cambs.sch.uk 
 

 
 
All siblings in school will have their photographs 
taken together before they go for their individual 
photos at the time allocated for their classes. 
 
If you would like your babies and toddler-age 
children to be photographed with siblings in 
school, please join us for our sibling photo 
session at 8.30am. 
 

 

We were overwhelmed with the response of 
families and community members to our appeal 
for support and sponsors for our Wyton 
Marathon on 30th September. It was great to see 
everyone working so hard, both in their individual 
efforts but also as part of a big school team. 
 
Our children have managed to raise a whopping 
£1,800 so far!  
 
We would be very grateful if any outstanding 
sponsor money or donations could be brought 
into school or paid on ParentPay by Friday, so 
that we can let the children know our final total. 
 

  
 
We’ve only been back in school for a month and 
have already accumulated a pile of lost property 
to rival the scale of Mount Kilimanjaro! 
 
In order to help us reunite your children with 
their belongings when they’ve misplaced them, 
we would like to ask you to label all their school 
things by next Monday 12th October. A laundry 
pen or Sharpie will last a through a whole year of 
washes, believe it or not! 
 
After that time, any jumpers or items taken off by 
children will be (neatly and discretely) labelled by 
a member of staff using our school permanent 
markers to ensure they can returned home safely 
with your child. 
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Our online calendar is the best way to keep up 
to date with upcoming school events. The link to 
our online calendar for parents is 
here: https://teamup.com/ksqqpu66iy6t7uiyt3 

 
School Events upcoming this half term: 
 

 Tues 7th October – Individual & sibling photos 

 Weds 22nd October 3.20pm – 4.30pm – End of 
half term ‘Meet the teacher and Book Look’  

 Fri 24th October - Last day of half term 

 Mon 3rd November – First day of Autumn half 
term 2 

 Thurs 13th Nov – Flu vaccinations 

 Wed 26th Nov – Christmas Fayre, 3:15-4:30 
 
WSCA (PTA) events upcoming this half term: 
 

 Friday 23rd October 7.30pm – Bingo 
(postponed until 6th February) 

 Thurs 23rd October – Halloween disco 

 Friday 14th Nov – Christmas Craft Fair, 7-
8:30pm 

 Thursday 27th Nov – Wreath Making 
Workshop, 7-9pm 

 Tues 16th Dec - Santa’s Grotto 

 Thurs 18th Dec – Chocolate Bingo, 5:30-7pm 
 

 
 
Don’t forget that our local libraries are open 
again this year (opening times below) and don’t 
forget that the mobile library service stops at 
Wyton on the Hill, on the main road just outside 
the school on the 3rd Wednesday of every month 
between 3.05pm and 3.40pm. 
 
For details on how to access the mobile library 
service, please use this link:  
 
https://www.cambridgeshire.gov.uk/residents/lib
raries-leisure-culture/libraries/visit-a-
library/mobile-libraries 

 
St Ives Library: 
 

 
 

For further information, including directions, please 
visit: 
https://www.cambridgeshire.gov.uk/directory/listings
/st-ives-library 
 
Huntingdon Library: 

 
 
For further information, please visit: 

https://www.cambridgeshire.gov.uk/directory/lis
tings/huntingdon-library-and-archives 
 
For further information about other local 
libraries, please follow this link: 
https://www.cambridgeshire.gov.uk/residents/lib
raries-leisure-culture/libraries/visit-a-
library/your-library 
 
 
And finally… 
 
As always, please do not hesitate to contact me 
with any queries, concerns or suggestions you 

https://teamup.com/ksqqpu66iy6t7uiyt3
https://www.cambridgeshire.gov.uk/residents/libraries-leisure-culture/libraries/visit-a-library/mobile-libraries
https://www.cambridgeshire.gov.uk/residents/libraries-leisure-culture/libraries/visit-a-library/mobile-libraries
https://www.cambridgeshire.gov.uk/residents/libraries-leisure-culture/libraries/visit-a-library/mobile-libraries
https://www.cambridgeshire.gov.uk/directory/listings/st-ives-library
https://www.cambridgeshire.gov.uk/directory/listings/st-ives-library
https://www.cambridgeshire.gov.uk/directory/listings/huntingdon-library-and-archives
https://www.cambridgeshire.gov.uk/directory/listings/huntingdon-library-and-archives
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may have regarding any aspect of school life. I am 
always happy to meet via telephone, Zoom or in 
person – or you can always catch me on the 
playground first thing every morning. 
 

Best wishes, 
 

  
Jo Phillips (Head Teacher) 


